BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.5 2013

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, |17 and 124 (1) {c) & (d)
of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part Il of Schedule 9 to the 1984 Act hereby
makes the above named Order.

#
The provisions of this Order will come intc operation on the / gQciay of /g/jw ~F1 2013
and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order
2008 as amended as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:

PART [0~ INDEX OF SCHEDULE

Part 8 Car Club Parking Places
Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time:
Add the letter “T" in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Part 12 Loading Bays
Part 12.1 Loading Only At Any Time:
Add the letter “N in the column headed “CPZ's"

Part |5 Police Pariing Bays
Part |5.1 Police Parking Bays At Any Time
Add the letter “N" in the column headed “CPZ’s”

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Controlled Parking Zone A

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time

Add new item 2: Hampstead Road ~ East side — From a point 33 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Robertson Road eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Controlled Parking Zone C

Part I.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Amend ltem 56 Old Steine: after “Princes Street” insert “and including the length between
Princes Street and Pavilion Parade”

Add new item 68a: Southdown Mews — North Side — From the western kerbline of
Freshfield Road westwards for a distance of 28 metres

Add new item 68b: Southdown Mews — South side - From the western kerbline of
Freshfield Road westwards for a distance of 29 metres



Add new item 68c: Southdown Mews — West side — From the southern property wall of
No.|9 Southdown Mews northwards for a distance of 15 metres

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
inclusive

Amend item 44 Royal Crescent Mews: delete the existing description and substitute
“From a point 14 metres north of the northern kerbline of Marine Parade northwards for
a distance of 23.5 metres.

Add new item 44a: East side — From a point 45 metres north of the northern kerbline of
Marine Parade northwards for a distance of 16.4 metres.

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking {for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am - 8pm inclusive

Amend item |9 South Avenue: delete existing side of road and description and substitute
“North side ~ From a point 8 metres west of the western kerbline of East Drive
westwards to a point opposite the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of South Avenue”.

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item [a Richmond Parade as item 5

Renumber existing item ib Richmond Street as item 6
Renumber existing item ¢ Richmond Street as item 7
Renumber existing item 2 Devonshire Place as item 3
Renurnizer existing e 3 YWilliam Street as item 9

Renumber existing item 4 VWWyndham Street as item 10

Add new item 2: Broad Street — East side ~ From a point |3 metres south of the southern
kerbline of St James’s Street southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 4: Madeira Place — East side — From a point 2| metres south of the
southern kerbline of St James’s Street southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item B: St James’s Avenue — East side — From a point 6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of St James’s Street northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 1 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend item 43 Royal Crescent Mews: delete “6 metres” and substitute “10 metres”
delete “3 metres” and substitute “4 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for Resident’s Permits
Delete item 23 Church Place

Amend Item 40 Grand Parade: in the column headed “Specific Properties” delete the
words “No.s 1-90 only”



Amend item 7| Old Steine: in the column headed “Specific Properties” delete the word
“included” and substitute “inclusive”

Amend Item 76 Pavilion Parade: in the column headed “Specific Properties” delete the
words “No.s |-1 1 only”

Controlled Parking Zone H

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item 7a: Belle Vue Gardens ~ West side — From a point |.5 metres south of the
northern property wall of Belle Vue Court southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres
{outside Belle Vue Court)

Add new item 80d: Maresfield Road — East side — From the boundary between Nos. 96 &
98 Maresfield Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.96)

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for Resident's Permits
Amend item 23 Church Place: insert “Excluding No.[4a” in column (3) Specific Properties
and insert “Excluding No.14a (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments

Controlled Parking Zone |
Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm

inclusive

Amend item 7% Vere Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
1.5 metres north of the property boundary of Nos. 40/42 Vere Road southwards to a
peint 1.5 metres north of the southern boundary of property No.1é Vere Road.”

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renurmber existing nem | Warlsigh Boad as jtem 3

Add new item {: Ditchling Rise — South side — From a point 6.5 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Shaftesbury Road eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Controlled Parking Zone M

Part [.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Amend Item 34 Western Road: delete the existing description and substitute “Between
Little Western Street and Palmeira Square (western arm)”

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am - 8pm inclusive

Amend item |8 Lansdowne Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point [0.5 metres east of the eastern kerbline of York Avenue eastwards for a distance of
27 metres”

Part 8.1 Streets eligible for Resident's Permits

Amend ltem 39 Western Road: in the column headed “Specific Properties” delete the
existing description and substitute “South side Nos.2 to 72 only (Little Western Street to
Palmeira Square) and north side Nos.82 to 134 only (Holland Road to Boundary Passage),
excluding No.l, Flats |, 2 & 3 of No.27A and No.41"



Controlled Parking Zone N
Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Delete existing item 4: Fourth Avenue (east)

Delete existing item 5: Fourth Avenue (west)

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Amend item 29 Salisbury Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 60.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a
distance of 43 metres”

Part 5.11 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 9 hours) from Monday to Friday 9am to épm
inclusive

Delete existing item 3a: Conway Street

Add new item 3a: Conway Street — North side — From a point 138.8 metres east of the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section) eastwards
for a distance of 21.] metres

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to i | hours) from Monday to Sunday between %am
and 8pm inclusive

Add new item 22a: Hova Villas — West side — From a point [0 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new tem 220 Hove Yillas ~ West side — From a point 20.5 metres north of the
narthern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 40.5 metres

Add new item 22c¢: Hova Villas - East side ~ From a point |3 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of | | metres

Add new item 22d: Hova Villas — East side — From a point 29 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards a distance of 32 metres

Part 6.1 Exclusive Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a period
of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Saturday between
9am and 6pm

Delete existing item 29: Hova Villas

Delete existing item 30: Hova Villas

Amend item 33 Norton Road: delete *15.2 metres” and substitute “26.2 metres” delete
“33 metres” and substitute “22 metres”

Add new item 35a: Salisbury Road - East side ~ From a point |3.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 40 metres.

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Renumber existing item | Clarendon Villas as item la



Add new item |: Albany Villas ~West side — From a point [0 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Church Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 3a: Medina Villas — East side ~ From a point |0 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Church Road southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new item 46a: Medina Villas — East side — From a point 34 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Kingsway northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.43)

Part {i.] Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing item |8: Conway Street

Add new item 18: Conway Street — North side - From a point 10%9.2 metres east of the
prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section) eastwards
for a distance of 22 metres

After existing Part 1 1.1 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part [2.! Loading Oniy At Any Time
:im Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From a point 34 metres east of the eastern
! Kingsway North | kerbline of Hove Street eastwards for a N
distance of || metres

After existing Part 14,1 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 15.] Police Parldng Bays At Any Time

lrern

No Street Mame | Side Description CPL

From a point 15.2 metres north of the

southern boundary of the Norton Road
Multi Storey car park northwards for a
distance of | | metres

i MNorton Road West

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for Resident's Permits
Amend |tem 80 Western Road: in the column headed *Specific Properties” delete *South
Side Nos 73 to 80 only” and substitute “South side Nos.73 to 81 only”

Controlled Parking Zone O

Part 4.2 Permit parking only from Monday to Saturday between 9am and 8pm
inclusive

Amend item 27 Holland Road: delete “and a point 3 metres” and substitute *“*and a point
23.5 metres” delete “107 and 109" and substitute “9% and 100”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Renumber existing item 8¢ Cromwell Road (outside No.38) as item 7b



Part 12.8 Loading Only Monday ~ Saturday 9am to épm (for a period of up to |
hour no return within { hour)

Amend item | The Drive: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
40.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Eaton Grove northwards for a distance of
1.6 metres”

Part 15.1 Police Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete this Part of the Schedule in its entirety.

Controlied Parking Zone Q

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours no return within 4 hours} from Monday
to Sunday between 9am — 8pm inclusive

Amend item 3 Chatsworth Road: delete “10 metres” and substitute “6 metres” delete “26
metres’” and substitute “30 metres”

Amend item 3a Chatsworth Road: delete “4| metres” and substitute “46 metres” delete
“tl metres” and substitute “6 metres”

Part 1 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing item 3: Chatsworth Road

Add new item 3: Chatsworth Road — West side — From as point 41 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Port Hall Road southwards for a distance of 5 metres

Part [8.1 Streets eligible for Resident's Permits
Add new item |2a: Lovers Wallk and in the column headed “Specific Properties” add
“MNos. | to 57

Add new iterm [2b: Lovers Walk Cottages and in the column headed “Specific Properties”
add “Nos. | to &7

Controlled Parking Zone R

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between %am - 8pm
inclusive

Delete existing item 20: Lawrence Road

Add new item 44a: Princes Avenue — North side — From a point 10.]1 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Aymer Road eastwards for a distance of 19.5 metres at 60 degrees to
the kerb

Add new item 44b: Princes Avenue — South side —- From a point 12.6 metres west of the
western kerbline of Hove Street westwards for a distance of |7 metres

Add new item 44c: Princes Avenue — South side — From a point 38.1 metres west of the
western kerbline of Hove Street westwards for a distance of 34 metres

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking { for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Delete existing item 7: Lawrence Road



Delete item |6: Princes Avenue

Add new item 16: Princes Avenue — North side — From a point 14 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Princes Square eastwards for a distance of 32 metres at 60 degrees to
the kerb

Add new item 16a: Princes Avenue — North side — From a point 6.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of Aymer Road westwards for a distance of 26 metres at 60 degrees to
the kerb

Add new item [6b: Princes Avenue — North side ~ From a point 0.} metres west of the
western kerbline of Hove Street westwards for a distance of 16.5 metres at 60 degrees to
the kerb

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking {for a period of up to | i hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am
and 8pm inclusive

Delete existing item |: Princes Avenue

Add new item |: Princes Avenue — Sotith side — From a point 6.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Princes Crescent eastwards for a distance of 30.5 metres

Add new item la: Princes Avenue - South side —~ From a point 41.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Princes Crescent eastwards for a distance of 32 metres

Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time
Add new item 3: Westbourne Street — West side — From a point 6.8 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Portland Road northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete existing item 25: Lawrence Road (outside No. 18}

Part I §.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing item[9: Lawrence Road

Part 4.1 Ambulance Parking Bay At Any Time
Delete existing item 2: Pembroke Crescent

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident's Permit
Delete existing item |6: Lawrence Road

Controlled Parking Zone T

After existing Part 7.4 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 8.1 City Car Club Only At Any Time

ftem

No Street Name | Side Description CPZ

From a point 9.5 metres south of the
I Hove Park Villas | East | southern kerbline of Wilbury Avenue T
southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres




Controlled Parking Zone W
Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Delete existing item |3: New Church Road

Delete existing item 14: New Church Road

Part 4.6 Permit Parking only from Monday to Sunday between [0-1lam and 7-
8pm inclusive

Add new ltem |3a: Lawrence Road — south side - From a point 4.8m west of the
prolongation of the western kerbline of Rutland Gardens to a point 6.8m east of the
eastern kerbline of Richardson Road

Add new ltem |3b: Lawrence Road — north side - From a point 5m west of the western
kerbline of Rutland Gardens to a point | m east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline
of Richardson Road

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 7: Langdale Gardens, Hove (outside No.2¢)

Add new Item | fa: Lawrence Road - south side - From the prolongation of the western
boundary of property No.|8 eastwards for a distance of 6m {outside No.18}

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident's Permit

Amend ltem 10 New Church Road: in the column “Specific Properties (3)" delete
“Between Hogarth Road and Coleman Avenue™ and substitute the following:

“North side between Richardson Road and Coleman Avenue (Odd MNos.77 to [ 15 only).
South side between Langdale Road and Wish Road {Even Nos.78 to |24 only)

Controlisd Parikng Zone ¥

Part 1.1 No Walting At Any Time

Amend ltern 38 Grand Parade: delete the existing description and substitute the following:
“From its junction with Richmond Parade southwards to the southern property boundary
of property No.43”

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday te Saturday $am to épm
Add new item 33: Whitecross Street — East side — From a point 27.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Cheapside southwards for a distance of 2.5 metres

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm
inclusive

Amend Item 50 Clifton Hill: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
7.5 metres north-west of the western kerbline of St Michael's Place north-westwards for a
distance of || metres”

Part 5.18 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Amend item 44 Whitecross Street: delete existing side of road and the description and
substitute “East side ~ From a point 14 metres north of the junction with Trafalgar Street
northwards for a distance of 16 metres”



Amend item 44 Whitecross Street: delete existing side of road and the description and
substitute “East side — From a point 63.5 metres north of the junction with Trafaigar
Street northwards for a distance of 33.5 metres”

Delete existing item 46 and substitute “Whitecross Street — West side — From a point 50
metres north of the junction with Trafalgar Street northwards for a distance of 39.5
metres”

Part 5.20 Shared permit Holders and High Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday

to Sunday between 9am to 8pm
Delete item 9: Clifton Hill

Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time
Renumber existing item ¢ Leopold Road as item |d

Renumber existing item 3a West Hill Road as item 3b

Add new item 3a: Victoria Road — North side ~ From a point 10 metres west of the
western kerbline of Powis Villas westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Amend item 4 Whitecross Street: delete “26 metres” and substitute “33.5 metres” insert
“southern” between “the” and “kerbline” delete “}{ | metres” and substitute “{ 1.5
metres”

Part i 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Add new item | 2: Elder Place — East side — From a point 5.7 metres north of the northern
kerbline of York Hill northwards for a distance of 5.9 metres

Part 18.] Streets eligible for a Resident’'s Permit
Drelete existing item 51: Grand Parade

Controlied Parking Zone Z

Part [.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Amend item 28 Grand Parade: delete the existing description and substitute the following:
“From the northern kerbline of Edward Street northwards to the northern property
boundary of No.44”

Amend ltem 57 Old Steine: delete the existing description and substitute the following:
“Whole length excluding the lengths from the northern kerbline of St James’s Street to
the junction with Princes Street and from the western kerbline of Princes Street to the
junction with Pavilion Parade”

Delete existing item 62: Pavilion Street
Delete existing item 68: Princes Street

Amend ltem 96 Western Road: delete the existing description and substitute “Between
Little VWestern Street and North Street”



Part 1.4 No waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to épm

Amend item 5 Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
14.5 metres south of the southern boundary of No.|5 Crown Street southwards for a
distance of 23 metres”

Amend item 7 Marlborough Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 35.5 metres south of the southern boundary wall of No.30 Marlborough Street
southwards, westwards then northwards for a distance of 29 metres”

Part 2.1 No Loading At Any Time
Delete and reinstate item |: Bond Street

Delete and reinstate item 2;: Bond Street
Delete and reinstate item 3: Bond Street
Delete and reinstate item 4: Bond Street
Delete existing item 6: Castle Square

Add new item 6: Castle Square — South side — From the eastern kerbline of East Street
eastwards for a distance of 2| metres

Add new item 6éa: Castle Square — South side — From the eastern boundary wali of No.4
Castle Square eastwards to the western kerbline of Old Steine

Add new item 6b: Castle Square — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Pavilion
Buildings eastwards to the western kerbline of Palace Place

Add new item éc: Castle Square — MNorth side — From the eastern kerbiine of Palace Place
eastwards for a distance of 4 metres

Add new item 6d: Castle Square — North side — From the western kerbline of Old Steine
westwards for a distance of [7.8 metres

Amend item 8 Hampton Place: delete existing side of road and the description and
substitute “both sides — From the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards to the
southern kerbline of Hampton Street”

Delete item 9: Hampton Place

Delete item 10: Hampton Place

Amend item || Marlborough Street: delete “north kerbline of Western Road” and
substitute “southern boundary wall of Nos. 169-174 Western Road”

Delete item |2: Montpelier Road

Amend item 15 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
western kerbline of Queens Road westwards for a distance of 6.8 metres”

10



Add new item [4a: North Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Queens
Road eastwards to the western kerbline of Windsor Street

Add new item |4b: North Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of Windsor
Street eastwards for a distance of 5 metres

Add new item l4c: North Street — North side — From the western kerbline of Portland
Street westwards for a distance of 3.5 metres

Amend item |5 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
eastern kerbline of King Place eastwards to the western kerbline of Bond Street”

Add new item 15a: North Street — North side — From the eastern kerbline of New Road
eastwards for a distance of 9.5 metres”

Add new item |5¢: North Street — North side — From a point 29.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of New Road eastwards for a distance of |7 metre

Delete existing item |16 North Street

Amend item {7 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
eastern kerbline of West Street eastwards to the eastern boundary wall of Nos. 55/56
North Street”

Add new item |7a: North Street — South side — From the eastern boundary wall of
Nos.51/52 North Street to the eastern boundary wall of No.4% North Street

Add new item [ 7h: North Street — South side — From the western kerbline of Ship Street
e the eastern boundary wall of Mos. 4143 North Soreex

Amend item [8 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 8 metres east of the eastern kerbline of Ship Street eastwards for a eastwards for a
distance of 8 metres”

Add new item |8a: North Street — South side — From a point 36.7 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Ship Street eastwards for a distance of 14.5 metres

Add new item i8b: North Street — South side — From a paoint 63.7 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Ship Street eastwards for a distance of 49 metres

Add new item 18c: North Street — South side — From a point 48.9 metres west of the
western kerbline of East Street westwards for a distance of 19.9 metres

Amend item 40 Western Road: delete existing side of road and the description and
substitute “North side — From a point 9.5 metres west of the western kerbline of Dyke

Road westwards for a distance of {7.5 metres”

Add new item 40a: Western Road — South side — From the western kerbline of Little
Preston Street westwards for a distance of |4 metres

Add new item 40b; Western Reoad — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Little
Preston Street eastwards to the western kerbline of Preston Street

11



Part 2.2 No Loading 8am to [ Ipm
Delete item 2: Dyke Road

Delete item 4: Western Road

Delete item 5: Western Road

Delete item 6: Western Road

Delete item 7: Western Road

Delete item 8: Western Road

Delete item 9: Western Road

Delete item 10: Western Road

Part 2.4 No Loading 8am ~ 9.30am & | lam - é6pm

Amend item | Western Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
western kerbline of Hampton Place westwards for a distance of 53.5 metres”

Delete item 2: Western Road

Renumber existing item 3 Western Road as item 2 and amend: delete existing side of road
and the description and substitute “South side — From a point 2.5 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Montpelier Road eastwards for a distance of 22 metres”

Add new term ) Western Road — Seuth side — From the western kerbline of Western
Terrace westwards for 2 distance of 10 metras

Add new item 4; Western Road ~ South side -~ From the eastern kerbline of Western
Terrace to the western kerbline of Sillwood Road

Add new item 5: Western Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Sillwood
Road eastwards for a distance of 6 metres

Add new item é: Western Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Preston
Street eastwards to the western kerbline of Castle Street

Add new item 7: Western Road — South side — From the western kerbline of Clarence
Square westwards to the western boundary wall of No.57 Western Road

Add new item 8; Western Road — South side — From the eastern kerbline of Clarence
Square eastwards for a distance of 96.5 metres

Part 2.6 No Loading Monday to Saturday 9am — épm
Amend item |3 Hampton Place: delete “3 metres” and substitute “8.8 metres”

Amend item |4 Hampton Street: delete existing side of road and substitute “north side”

12



Amend item |5 Hampton Street: delete existing side of road and substitute “ north side”
delete “30 metres” and substitute “41 metres”

Add new item 15: Hampton Street — South side —~ From the western kerbline of Spring
Street to the eastern kerbline of Hampton Place

Add new item 16 Preston Street — west side — From the southern kerbline of Western
Road southwards for a distance of 17 metres

Amend item 32 West Street: delete |6 metres” and substitute “18 metres”

Part 2.8 No Loading Monday to Saturday 10 am -4pm
Renumber existing ltem | West Street as Item 6 and amend description: delete
“northern” and substitute “southern” delete “40 metres” and substitute 16 metres”

Renumber existing item 2 Market Street as item 5
Renumber existing item 5 Brighton Place as item |
Renumber existing item 6 Brighton Place as item 2

Part 2.14 No Loading/Unloading Monday yo Saturday 8am to 9.30am and 4pm
tc épm

Renumber existing item | Western Road as item 2 and delete the existing description and
substitute “From a point | | metres east of the eastern kerbiine of Montpelier Road
eastwards for a distance of |3 metres”

Add new item | North Street — Both sides ~ From the western boundary wall of Mo, 79
Morth Streetr eastwards to the eastern boundary wall of Nos, 75/76 North Strees

Add new item 3: Western Road — North side — From a peint 55 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Montpelier Road eastwards for a distance of 16 metres

Part 4.1 Permit Parking Only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
inclusive

Amend item |3 Castle Street: delete “Castle Street” and substitute “Western Road”
delete 10 metres” and substitute “I1 metres”

Amend item 28 Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 13.5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a
distance of 33.5 metres”

Amend item 29 Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 65 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a
distance of 18 metres”

Amend item 30 Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute *From the
southern boundary wall of No.15 Crown Street southwards for a distance of 8.5 metres”
Amend item 3| Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point [5 metres north of the northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a
distance of 31 metres”

13



Amend item 32 Dean Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
10 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a
distance of 24 metres”

Add new item 32a: Dean Street — West side — From a point 39.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a distance of 48.5 metres

Add new item 32b: Dean Street — West side — From a point |5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a distance of 16 metres

Amend item 33 Hampton Place: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 10.5 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a
distance of 62.5 metres”

Amend item 34 Hampton Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point |15 metres west of the western kerbline of Spring Street westwards for a distance of
5.5 metres”

Amend item 36 Maritborough Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From
a point 9 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a
distance of 27.5 metres”

Add new item 36a: Marlborough Street — East side — From a point 47 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a distance of 16.5 metres

Add new item 36b: Marlborough Street — East side — From the southern boundary wall of
N30 Marlborough Street northwards for a distance of B.5 metres

Amend item 41 Montpelier Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 58.8 metres south of the scuthern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a
distance of 33.5 metres”

Amend item 43 Montpelier Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 32 metres north of the southern boundary wall of No.39 Montpelier Road
northwards for a distance of 41 metres”

Amend item 44 Montpelier Road: delete “41 metres” and substitute *35.5 metres”

Amend item 45 Montpelier Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
southern boundary wall of No.39 Montpelier Road northwards for a distance of 1 1.5
metres”

Amend item 72 Queen Square: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 2.5 metres north of the southern property boundary of No.12 Queen Square
northwards for a distance of 8 metres (echelon bays)”

Amend item 95 Sillwood Road: delete existing description and substitute “From a point

t4.5 metres south of the southern kerbline of Western Road southwards to a point 6
metres north of the northern kerbline of Sillwood Street”

14



Amend item 116 Western Terrace: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 43 metres south of the southern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a
distance of | 1.5 metres”

Part 5.18 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between %am to 8pm inclusive

Amend item 16 Montpelier Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 46 metres north of the northern kerbline of Sillwood Street northwards for a
distance of | | metres”

Amend item 17 Montpelier Road: delete existing description and substitute “From the
southern boundary wall of No.27 Montpelier Road southwards for a distance of 62.5
metres”

Part 5.20 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between $am - 8pm inclusive

ftem | Street Side of
Description CPZ
No. | Name Road P
. From a point 10 metres west of the western
Montpelier .
2a North | kerbline of Norfolk Terrace westwards for a Z
Place .
distance of 2| metres

Part 6.4 Exclusive High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a period
of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Sunday between
9am and dpm inclusive

Amend itern 7 East street: after “27.5 metres” insert "north of the northern kerbline of
Kings Road”

Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time
Add new item 6: Russell Square — North side — From a point 2| metres west of the
western kerbline of Cannon Place westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Add new item 7: Upper North Street — North side — From the boundary wall between
Nos. 87 & 88 North Street eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Amend item 6 Crown Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
8.5 metres south of the southern boundary wall of No.|5 Crown Street southwards for a
distance of 6 metres (outside No.{2)”

Amend item 7 Dean Street; delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
34 metres south of the southern kerbline of Upper North Street southwards for a
distance of 5.5 metres (outside No.26)"

Amend item 8 Preston Street: delete existing description and substitute “From a point {2
metres south of the southern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a distance of 15

metres”

Amend item |6 Montpelier Road: delete “|5 metres” and substitute 18 metres”

15



Delete existing item |9: Palace Place (opposite No.2)

Amend item 2| Queen Square: delete the description and substitute “From the southern
property boundary of No.12 Queen Square northwards for a distance of 2.5 metres
(echelon bay) (outside No.[2)"

Part 9.2 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Monday to Sunday 2am to 6pm
Amend item | Castle Street: delete “8 metres” and substitute “1 | metres” delete “13.2
metres” and substitute | 1.5 metres”

Amend item 6 Hampton Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 41 metres east of the eastern kerbline of Hampton Place eastwards for a distance of
5.5 metres (rear of Mitre House)”

Amend item [ | Sillwood Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 9 metres south of the southern kerbline of YWestern Road southwards for a distance
of 5.5 metres (adjoining No.86 Western Road)”

Part 9.4 Disabled Badge Holders Parking Places Maximum Length of Stay 3
hours no return within | hour

Amend item | Jubilee Street: delete “2| metres” and substitute “22.5 metres” delete “20
metres’” and substitute “2| metres”

Amend item 2 Jubilee Street: delete “51 metres” and substitute “73.5 metres”

Part 1 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend item |5 Little Preston Street: delete existing description and substitute “From a
point 6 metres south of the southern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a distance

) B9
O o MSTran

Amend item |7 Montpelier Road: delete the existing description and substitute “From a
point 32 metres north of the southern boundary wall of No.39 Montpelier Road
northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres”

Amend item 24 Queen Square: delete “5 metres” and substitute “6 metres”

Delete item 26: Sillwood Road

Part 12.1 Loading only At Any Time
Delete existing item 5 Castle Square

Add new itern 5: Castle Square — North side — From a point 4 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Palace Place eastwards for a distance of 14.3 metres

Amend item 8 Dean Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From a point
37.5 metres north of the nerthern kerbline of Western Road northwards for a distance of

6.5 metres”

Amend item [3a Jubilee Street: delete “43 metres” and substitute “43.5 metres” delete
“21 metres” and substitute “23 metres”

16



Amend item [9 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
eastern boundary wall of Nos. 55/56 North Street eastwards to the eastern boundary wall
of Nos. 51/52 North Street”

Amend item 20 North Street: delete the existing description and substitute “From the
eastern boundary wall of No.4% North Street eastwards to the eastern boundary wall of
Nos. 41/43 North Street”

Amend item 2| North Street: delete “18 metres” and substitute *13 metres” delete “16
metres” and substitute “23.7 metres”

Amend item 22 North Street; delete “48 metres” and substitute “5{ metres” delete “18
metres” and substitute “12.5 metres”

Amend item 23 North Street: delete *28 metres” and substitute “37 metres” delete “24
metres” and substitute “12 metres”

Part 13.1 Taxi Ranlc At Any Time
Amend item 7 Queen Square: delete “29 metres” and substitute “34 metres”

Amend item 8 Queen Square: delete “34 metres” and substitute “29 metres”

Part 13.2 Taxi Rank & Loading Bay
Amend item 2 Western Road: delete “13.5 metres” and substitute “16.5 metres” delete
“15 metres” and substitute “1 3 metres”

Part 16.1 Public Service Vehicles At Any Time
Amend item | Montpelier Road: delete “27 metres” and substitute “23 metres” delete 172
metres” and substitute “16 metres”

Part 18.]1 Streets eligibie for a Resident’s Permit
Delete existing item 48 Grand Parade

Amend [tem 88 Old Steine: in the column “Specific Properties (3)” delete the existing
description and substitute the following: “Excluding Royal York Buildings and ali the
properties on the east side (Nos.| — 32 inclusive)”

Delete existing item 94 Pavilion Parade
Delete existing item [02 Princes Street

MADE UNDER THE COMMON SEAL OF
BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL

this /<" day of ﬁfz}:é:;r"x;.gam/; 2013

THE COMMOCN SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE CIiTY
COUNCIL wéis affixed to this Order in the presence of

LY )
AL
................. R S N U

Authorised Ofﬁcer

17






